RESOLUTION NO. 2026 — 62

TO AWARD BID FOR THE 24™ STREET SE WATER LINE EXTENSION
TO WILLOUGHBY CONTRACTING CO., INC.

WHEREAS, bids were received on January 15, 2026 at 2:00 p.m. for the 24 Street SE water line extension project; and

WHEREAS, the following bids were opened:

Apel Machine & Supply Co., Inc. Cullman, AL $1,267,601.00
Baird Contracting Co., Inc. Birmingham, AL $1,445,910.00
Centerline Contracting, Inc. Tuscaloosa, AL $1,306,604.50
Cleary Construction, Inc. Thompkinsville, KY No Bid
Construct Connect Cincinnati, OH No Bid
Cox Contracting Co., Inc. Bessemer, AL $1,967,940.00
Cumberland Pipeline, LLC Columbia, KY No Bid
Eubank Construction Co., Inc. Booneville, MS No Bid
Gillespie Construction, LLC Jasper, AL $1,879,300.00
Global Construction and Engineering, Inc. Birmingham, AL $1,879,656.00
Jordan Excavating Company, LLC Birmingham, AL $1,988,000.00
Kitchens Excavating, LLC Kimberly, AL No Bid
Lambert Contracting, LLC Hollywood, AL No Bid
PipeWorks Plus, Inc. Fayetteville, TN No Bid
Powell Builders, Inc. Hayden, AL $2,234,150.00
Rast Construction, Inc. Birmingham, AL $1,723,510.00
Rev Construction, Inc. Tuscaloosa, AL No Bid
Russo Corporation Birmingham, AL No Bid
Southern Directional, Inc. Alabaster, AL No Bid
Talley Lambert Construction, LLC Flat Rock, AL $2,527,770.00
Tren-Tay, Inc. Jasper, AL $1,364,900.00
Timberline Construction Group, LLC Pelham, AL No Bid
Willoughby Contracting Co., Inc. Birmingham, AL $1,233,535.00

WHEREAS, the recommendation is to award the bid to Willoughby Contracting Co, Inc., the lowest responsible bidder; and

BE IT RESOLVED by the Cullman City Council that the bid for the 24" Street SE water line extension project be awarded to
Willoughby Contracting Co., Inc. the lowest responsible bidder, in the amount of $1,233,535.00.

ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL this the 27th day of January, 2026.

President of the City Council
ATTEST:

City Clerk

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR this the 27th day of January, 2026.

Mayor



Docusign Envelope ID: 74FA7E8F-E7D3-47FB-ADDF-5A16814D6FFF

24th Street S.E. Water Line Extension City of Cullman, Alabama Bid Opening: January 15, 2026

Addenda Bid
Address Contact Name Email Addres: Ph N i
Company a ress one Number 1thrus | Security Base Bid Amount Alternate Base Bid Amount
Apel Maching & Supply o% = PO Box 2010, Cullman, AL- _\ m Y] r% )
Cullman 35058-2010 John Apel jfa@apelmachine.com 256-338-2288 ,\ . \ ’ b. & \N m ﬁv « — .V‘m h%\ “ “ B L
5801 Grover Burchfield Drive, y
REV Construction Tuscaloosa, AL-35401 Melanie Tucker mtucker@revconstructioninc.com 205-807-4868
1421 Mims Avenue SW, _
Russo Corportion Birmingham, AL-35211 Cindy Johnsan clohnson@russocorp.com 205-923:4434
740 Volare Drive, Birmingham, % ] 8 IO (& g 00
Jordan:Excavating Company, LLC (\>r.mmmﬁ Rusty Palmer rusty@jordan-excavating.com 205-987-0534 z\ v’ \ 1 % % % I's Q S %\ W % ; % WNV [ .\
3825 Edwards Rd, Cincinnati,
ConstructConnect  ~ 0OH-45209 Eric Mills content@constiuctconnect.com 800-364-2059
— |87 Pardue Road, Pelham, AL-
Timberline Construction Group 35124 Clay Curtis ccurtis@timberlinecg.com 205-848-8300
2550 Cone Dr, Birmingham, AL- rm ST Do 1 .~
% Willoughby Contracting Co., Inc. ' 35217 Scott Burdette scott.burdette@live.com 2059107837 (\. (\\ ~ i w w w v w. W .m.. % .V W M. VQHG o
_ 2011 N Second Street,
Eubank Construction Co, Inc Booneville, MS-38829 Alan Thompson alan.thompson@ecc-inc.net 662-728-2046
__—  |2006 Edmonton Road,
Cleary Construction, Inc. Tompkinsville, KY-42167 Ryan Comwell estimating@clearyconst.com 270-487-1784
—_— 306 Steelman Loop Rd,
PipeWorks Plus, Inc. Fayetteville, TN-37334 Kristen Grant kholloway@pipeworksplus.net 931-759-4125
276 Sniow Dr, Birmingham, AL- D0 ¥ s
Baird Contracting Co., In¢ W |as209 Tammy Hughes thughes@balrdcontracting.net 205-942-1095 f\ v &; {xq @ \ G w m.w JN I.V\ O
161 Shipp Road, Hayden, AL-
Powell Builders Inc. v~ |35059 John Micheal Powell  |impowell16@gmail.com 205-617-5620 v/ v .m bq‘ nu W r\ \ M; rw \ W W M Q WQ \..l v/
5558 Curry Highway Suite 8,
Tren-Tay Inc. (\u Jasper, AL-35503 [Kevin Farley farley7km@gmall.com 205-387-7790 ‘\ C\ @ ~ MW ﬁ FN« % Q .@, M U. \M\ V.WG e .\\
2123 9th Street, Tuscaloosa, AL- me <<
Centerline Contracting, Inc ’\ 35401 Johnnie Rhodes johnnie@centerlinecontracting.org 205-764-9950 a\ \ r@ \ W Q ﬁ m On\ m % \ \W\ \ W h . —_ \
2801 Shannon Oxmoor Rd., i
Rast Construction, Inc: .\ Birmingham, AL-35211 John Wanhatalo jwanhatalo@rastconstruction.com 205942688 _.\ il .\ﬁ \ l\b.w W\_ Q % Wh \.__ mu % no ' v
4565 highway 5, jasper, AL- . o
Gillespie Construction LLC e 35503 McKinlee Gillespie mgillespie@gillespieconstruction.net 205-295-5263 v’ e \x % V W W Q Q . \I {& N \ M N m L\mlx v
PO BOX 464, HOLLYWOOD, AL- | E
Lambert ContractingLLC ~— 35752 Cody Lambert office@lambert-contracting.com 256:599-7141
- 1032 Derby Parkway, Kimberly,
Kitchens Excavating, LLC AL - 35091 Todd Kitchens todd@kitchens-excavating.com 205-521-3229
2909 Cane Valley Mill Road, .
Cumberiand Pipeline llc Columbia, KY-12728 Bo Ellison bellison@cumberlandpipeline.com 2703859000
150 Airpark Industrial Drive,
Southern Directional, Inc Alabaster, AL-35007 Bruce Smith bruce@southerndirectional.com 205-419-5209
Talley Lambert Constriiction LLC (\ 35966 Talley Lambert tclamberi0l@ime.com 25689966225 o\ &: U_ ﬂ.w .N. Q\NO« - ,@ “ v, W O\\ w .W p p| —— -
233 Spring Water Farms, o9
Cox contracting K\ Bessemer, AL-35022 Jason jsondau@icloud.com 2055272190 v lﬁ _ W ﬁ Q pr\Q ’ o il . \T@) e v
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COUNCIL AGENDA REQUEST

1.16.
Date: 01.16.2026
hris F
Department: Water Name: Chris Freeman
Phone: 256-775-7211 or 256-736-4822 Email: cfreeman@cullmanal.gov

Type of request (select all that apply):

___Alcohol License ___Annexation _X Bid Award
____Budget Amendment ____Change Order __ Codification Change
___Contract Approval ___ Petition ___Proclamations

___ Public Comment ___Resolution ___ Rezoning
___Special Event __ Tax Abatement ___Variance

__ Other

Reason for Request:
To view and consjder the bids as sent.

Supporting Documentation:
_X Attach supporting gocumentation.

ocusSign

Signature: (luris Frowmam,

7B46B0O0DBS8E4AS. ..

Approval Sequence:
1. Administration — City Clerk’s Office

Verifies form is completed and proper documentation is attached.

X_Approved to Move Forward ___ Rejected __ Return to Requestor
Commentgr—_Signed by:
' J 20,2026 10-12-AM CST
Signature pm IVLS(,R, Date:January ZU, 2020 1012

6F02210223EC457 ...

2. Council Committee Chairperson
Ensures necessity of the requested expense.

X Approved to Move Forward ____Rejected ___Return to Admin
Commen *—signed by:
Signatur@ﬂi Selaffr DatedJanuary 20, 2026 | 10:16 AM CST
CF207C9F2261441...
3. Council President
_X Approved for Council Agenda ___ Rejected ___Return to Committee
Comments:—sinean,, Ki M Hal |
Signatur{%né?(\l@u Date-January 20, 2026 | 3:36 PM CST
§73FSC72COC944B.,.
4. Administration - City Clerk’s Office

01/ 26/ 2026

_X Added to Council éﬁ;enda Date of Meeting:
Comments:—sgneary: O 1Y €Tk
Signature: (N ¢ Masny patedJanuary 20, 2026 | 4:42 PM CST

6F02210223EC457 ...
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