
 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 2026-102 

TO AWARD BID FOR HOT AND COLD MIX TO ROGERS GROUP, INC 

 

WHEREAS, bids (PW2026-10) were opened on May 14, 2026 at 2:00 p.m. for hot and cold mix for the City of Cullman; and 

 

WHEREAS, the following bids were opened: 

 

Bradley Neal Excavating, Inc.   Huntsville, AL   No response 

C and C Asphalt and Concrete Construction  Guntersville, AL    No response 

Carcel & G Construction, LLC   Hanceville, AL    No response 

Central Alabama Asphalt and Construction Co, LLC Tuscaloosa, AL    No bid 

Charles E. Watts, Inc    Gadsden, AL   No response 

Chilton Contractors, Inc.    Clanton, AL    No response 
Dennis Green’s Paving    Hanceville, AL    No response 

Dunn Construction Co., Inc.   Birmingham, AL   No Bid  

Grayson Carter and Son Contracting, Inc.  Athens, AL   Various bid items 

Jones Brothers Asphalt Paving   Cullman, AL   No response 

Norris Paving, Inc.    Birmingham, AL   No response 

Richard Cooper Asphalt Paving   Hanceville, AL    No response 

S & S Asphalt Paving    Hanceville, AL   No response 

Rogers Group, Inc.    Huntsville, AL    Various bid items 

Vulcan Materials Asphalt and Construction, LLC Gadsden, AL   Various bid items  

Wheeler Contracting, LLC    Arley, AL   No response 

Wiregrass Construction Co., Inc.   Birmingham, AL   Various bid items 
   

 

WHEREAS, the low bidder for hot and cold mix is Rogers Group, Inc.; and  

 

   

WHEREAS, the Cullman City Council has evaluated the bids received and has determined that Rogers Group, Inc. is the lowest 

responsible bidder. 

   

 

BE IT RESOLVED by the Cullman City Council that the bid for hot and cold mix be awarded to Rogers Group, Inc. 

 

  

ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL this the 26th day of May, 2026.  

____________________________________ 

President of the City Council 

ATTEST: 

__________________________________                   

City Clerk        

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR this the 26th day of May, 2026.         

 

         _____________________________________  

         Mayor 
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COUNCIL AGENDA REQUEST 

 

Date: _________________________________________ 

Department: __________________________________ Name: _______________________________________ 

Phone: ________________________________________ Email: _______________________________________ 

Type of request (select all that apply): 

___ Alcohol License      ___ Annexation     ___ Bid Award   
___ Budget Amendment   ___ Change Order   ___ Codification Change  
___ Contract Approval   ___ Petition   ___ Proclamations  
___ Public Comment    ___ Resolution   ___ Rezoning   
___ Special Event    ___ Tax Abatement   ___ Variance   
___ Other 
Reason for Request: 

____________________________________________________________________________________________

____________________________________________________________________________________________

____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

Supporting Documentation: 

___ Attach supporting documentation.  

 

Signature: __________________________________________________________________________________  

 

Approval Sequence: 

1. Administration – City Clerk’s Office 

Verifies form is completed and proper documentation is attached. 

    ___ Approved to Move Forward   ___ Rejected     ___ Return to Requestor    

Comments: __________________________________________________________________________ 

Signature: ____________________________________ Date:__________________________________ 

 

2. Council Committee Chairperson   -  ____________________________________________________  

Ensures necessity of the request.  

 ___ Approved to Move Forward   ___ Rejected       ___ Return to Admin      

Comments: __________________________________________________________________________ 

Signature: _____________________________________ Date:_________________________________ 

 

3. Council President 

 ___ Approved for Council Agenda  ___ Rejected     ___ Return to Committee       

Comments: __________________________________________________________________________ 

Signature: _____________________________________ Date:_________________________________ 

 

4. Administration – City Clerk’s Office 

 ___ Added to Council Agenda  Date of Meeting: ______________ 

Comments: __________________________________________________________________________ 

Signature: ____________________________________ Date:__________________________________ 
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X

 

 

 

pleslie@cullmanal.gov

Street

256-775-7104

 

 

05/19/2026

 

X

To award bid for hot and cold mix.

X

 

 

Pam Leslie

X  

May 19, 2026 | 4:31 PM CDT

 

May 19, 2026 | 4:35 PM CDT

  X

Jason Willoughby

May 19, 2026 | 8:52 PM CDT

 X  

X

05/20/2026

05/26/2026



AMENDED

Annual 

Estimate

FOB at Plant 
(Price per 

Delivered to 
Site (Price Per 

FOB at Plant 
(Price per 

Delivered to 
Site (Price Per 

FOB at Plant 
(Price per 

Delivered to 
Site (Price Per 

FOB at Plant 
(Price per 

Delivered to 
Site (Price Per 

FOB at Plant 
(Price per 

Delivered to 
Site (Price Per 

1 ton $90.00 $95.00 $140.00 $151.50 $135.00 $150.00 $125.00 $140.00 NO BID NO BID

Annual 

Estimate

FOB at Plant 
(Price per 
Ton) with 

Delivered to 
Site (Price Per 

Ton) with 

FOB at Plant 
without RAP

Delivered 
without RAP

FOB at Plant 
(Price per 
Ton) with 

Delivered to 
Site (Price Per 

Ton) with 

FOB at Plant 
without RAP

Delivered 
without RAP

FOB at Plant 
(Price per 
Ton) with 

Delivered to 
Site (Price Per 

Ton) with 

FOB at Plant 
without RAP

Delivered 
without RAP

FOB at Plant 
(Price per 
Ton) with 

Delivered to 
Site (Price Per 

Ton) with 

FOB at Plant 
without RAP

Delivered 
without RAP

FOB at Plant 
(Price per 
Ton) with 

Delivered to 
Site (Price Per 

Ton) with 

FOB at Plant 
without RAP

Delivered 
without RAP

1 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $84 $96 $90 $102 $76 $91 $90 $105 $95 $110 $105 $120 $75 $90 $90 $105

15,000 tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,230,000 $1,402,500 $1,320,000 $1,492,500 $1,050,000 $1,275,000 $1,275,000 $1,500,000 $1,192,500 $1,417,500 $1,425,000 $1,650,000 $1,080,000 $1,305,000 $1,305,000 $1,530,000

1 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $82 $94 $88 $100 $70 $85 $85 $100 $80 $95 $95 $110 $72 $87 $87 $102

1 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $82 $94 $88 $100 $70 $85 $85 $100 $80 $95 $95 $110 $72 $87 $87 $102

10,000 tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $750,000 $865,000 $830,000 $945,000 $575,000 $725,000 $800,000 $950,000 $745,000 $895,000 $850,000 $1,000,000 $670,000 $820,000 $820,000 $970,000

1 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $70 $82 $78 $90 $54 $69 $75 $90 $70 $90 $80 $100 $59 $74 $74 $89

15,000 tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,050,000 $1,222,500 $1,170,000 $1,342,500 $802,500 $1,027,500 $1,125,000 $1,350,000 $1,050,000 $1,275,000 $1,200,000 $1,425,000 $885,000 $1,110,000 $1,110,000 $1,335,000

1 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $70 $82 $78 $90 $54 $69 $75 $90 $70 $90 $80 $100 $59 $74 $74 $89

1 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $75 $87 $83 $95 $58 $73 $80 $95 $75 $90 $85 $100 $67 $82 $82 $97

1 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $70 $82 $78 $90 $54 $69 $75 $90 $70 $85 $80 $95 $59 $74 $74 $89

5,000 tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $350,000 $407,500 $390,000 $447,500 $267,500 $342,500 $375,000 $450,000 $350,000 $425,000 $400,000 $475,000 $295,000 $370,000 $370,000 $445,000

1 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $70 $82 $78 $90 $54 $69 $75 $90 $70 $90 $80 $100 $59 $74 $74 $89

1 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $140 $152 $78 $90 $135 $150 $75 $90 $125 $140 $80 $95 $59 $74 $74 $89

$3,380,743 $3,898,347 $3,710,739 $4,228,343 $2,695,623 $3,370,758 $3,575,715 $4,250,850 $3,338,234 $4,013,384 $3,875,780 $4,550,930 $2,930,581 $3,605,716 $3,605,716 $4,280,851

AAP - ADVANCED ASPHALT PRODUCTS

PW2026-10

05.14.2026

2:00 PM

CITY OF CULLMAN

BID TAB SHEET

HOT AND COLD MIX

Bid Number:

Date:

Time:

COLD MIX - 
Alternate #1 - Without Recycled Materials

GRAYSON CARTER AND SON ROGERS GROUP

Cold Mix, Plant AL 411A000 Cold Mix

424B650 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper 
Binder Layer, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, 
ESAL Range C/D

424C364 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete Base 
Layer, Patching, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, 
ESAL Range C/D

424A356 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete 
Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8" Maximum Aggregate 
Size Mix, ESAL Range C/D

424A366 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete 
Wearing Surface Layer, Leveling, 1/2" Maximum 
Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range C/D

424A363 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete 
Wearing Surface Layer, Patching, 1/2" Maximum 
Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL Range C/D

424A360 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete 
Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2" Maximum Aggregate 
Size Mix, ESAL Range C/D

HOT MIX

TOTAL

HOT MIX $15,218,171.00 $13,892,945.00

424B651 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper 
Binder Layer, 1” Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL 
Range C/D

424B655 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper 
Binder Layer, Patching, 1” Maximum Aggregate Size 
Mix, ESAL Range C/D

424B689 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete Lower 
Binder Layer, Leveling, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size 
Mix, ESAL Range C/D

424B681 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete Lower 
Binder Layer, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL 
Range C/D

424B685 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete Lower 
Binder Layer, Patching, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size 
Mix, ESAL Range C/D

424B658 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper 
Binder Layer, Leveling, 3/4" Maximum Aggregate Size 
Mix, ESAL Range C/D

424B659 Ton Superpave Bituminous Concrete Upper 
Binder Layer, Leveling, 1" Maximum Aggregate Size 
Mix, ESAL Range C/D

NO  BID

$265.00 NO BIDCOLD MIX $185.00 $291.50 $285.00

VULCAN WIREGRASS

INCOMPLETE

$15,778,327.00 $14,422,864.00

INCOMPLETE BID $15,218,462.50 $13,893,230.00 $15,778,592.00
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