
 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 2026-101 

TO AWARD BID FOR CONCRETE PIPE TO FOLEY PRODUCTS COMPANY, LLC 

 

WHEREAS, bids (PW2026-09) were opened on May 14, 2026 at 1:00 p.m. for concrete pipe for the City of Cullman; and 

 

WHEREAS, the following bids were opened: 

 

Bradley Neal Excavating, Inc.   Huntsville, AL   No response 

Central Pipe & Supply, Inc.   Pearl, MS   No response 

Contractor Service & Fabrication, Inc.  Decatur, AL    No response 

Foley Products Company, LLC   Cullman, AL   Various bid items 

Harvey Culvert Co.    Cleveland, AL    No response 

The Shaddix Company    Cullman, AL    Various bid items 
 

WHEREAS, the low bidder for concrete pipe is Foley Products Company; and  

 

   

WHEREAS, the Cullman City Council has evaluated the bids received and has determined that Foley Products Company is the lowest 

responsible bidder. 

   

 

BE IT RESOLVED by the Cullman City Council that the bid for concrete pipe be awarded to Foley Products Company. 

 

 
  

ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL this the 26th day of May, 2026.  

 

____________________________________ 

President of the City Council 

ATTEST: 

 

__________________________________                   

City Clerk  

       

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR this the 26th day of May, 2026.         

 

         _____________________________________  

         Mayor 
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COUNCIL AGENDA REQUEST 

 

Date: _________________________________________ 

Department: __________________________________ Name: _______________________________________ 

Phone: ________________________________________ Email: _______________________________________ 

Type of request (select all that apply): 

___ Alcohol License      ___ Annexation     ___ Bid Award   
___ Budget Amendment   ___ Change Order   ___ Codification Change  
___ Contract Approval   ___ Petition   ___ Proclamations  
___ Public Comment    ___ Resolution   ___ Rezoning   
___ Special Event    ___ Tax Abatement   ___ Variance   
___ Other 
Reason for Request: 

____________________________________________________________________________________________

____________________________________________________________________________________________

____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

Supporting Documentation: 

___ Attach supporting documentation.  

 

Signature: __________________________________________________________________________________  

 

Approval Sequence: 

1. Administration – City Clerk’s Office 

Verifies form is completed and proper documentation is attached. 

    ___ Approved to Move Forward   ___ Rejected     ___ Return to Requestor    

Comments: __________________________________________________________________________ 

Signature: ____________________________________ Date:__________________________________ 

 

2. Council Committee Chairperson   -  ____________________________________________________  

Ensures necessity of the request.  

 ___ Approved to Move Forward   ___ Rejected       ___ Return to Admin      

Comments: __________________________________________________________________________ 

Signature: _____________________________________ Date:_________________________________ 

 

3. Council President 

 ___ Approved for Council Agenda  ___ Rejected     ___ Return to Committee       

Comments: __________________________________________________________________________ 

Signature: _____________________________________ Date:_________________________________ 

 

4. Administration – City Clerk’s Office 

 ___ Added to Council Agenda  Date of Meeting: ______________ 

Comments: __________________________________________________________________________ 

Signature: ____________________________________ Date:__________________________________ 
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X

 

Street

05/19/2026

 

 

 

X

Pam Leslie

 

 

256-775-7104

 

 

 

pleslie@cullmanal.gov

X

 

To award the bid for concrete pipe

 

 

 

 X

May 19, 2026 | 1:38 PM CDT

 

 

Jason Willoughby

May 19, 2026 | 3:20 PM CDT

X  

  X

May 19, 2026 | 9:05 PM CDT

X

05/20/2026

05/26/2026



QUANTITY PIPE DIAMETER SIZE
UNIT PRICE, PER LINEAR 
FOOT EXTENDED ___foot joint

UNIT PRICE, PER LINEAR 
FOOT EXTENDED ____ foot joint

200 feet, more or less 12 inch diameter, ____ foot joint $37.39 $7,478.00 (Class 5) 8' No Bid

200 feet, more or less 15 inch diameter, ____ foot joint $25.58 $5,116.00 8' $24.60 $4,920.00 (IL) 8'

200 feet, more or less 18 inch diameter, ____ foot joint $29.65 $5,930.00 8' $30.57 $6,114.00 (IL) 8'

200 feet, more or less 24 inch diameter, ____ foot joint $43.69 $8,738.00 8' $46.75 $9,350.00 (IL) 8'

200 feet, more or less 30 inch diameter, ____ foot joint $62.77 $12,554.00 8' $63.28 $12,656.00 (IL) 8'

200 feet, more or less 36 inch diameter, ____ foot joint $82.24 $16,448.00 8' $92.40 $18,480.00 (IL) 8'

200 feet, more or less 42 inch diameter, ____ foot joint $105.67 $21,134.00 8' $125.00 $25,000.00 (IL) 8'

200 feet, more or less 48 inch diameter, ____ foot joint $140.89 $28,178.00 8' $165.00 $33,000.00 (IL) 8'

200 feet, more or less 54 inch diameter, ____ foot joint $184.95 $36,990.00 8' $197.20 $39,440.00 (Cwall) 8'

200 feet, more or less 60 inch diameter, ____ foot joint $236.36 $47,272.00 8' $236.00 $47,200.00 (Cwall) 8'

200 feet, more or less 72 inch diameter, ____ foot joint $351.52 $70,304.00 8' $323.50 $64,700.00 (Cwall) 8'

8'

8'

200 feet, more or less 12 inch EQUIV diameter, ____ foot joint NA 8' No Bid 8'

200 feet, more or less 15 inch EQUIV diameter, ____ foot joint $42.37 $8,474.00 8' $45.08 $9,016.00 8'

200 feet, more or less 18 inch  EQUIV diameter, ____ foot joint $50.85 $10,170.00 8' $53.22 $10,644.00 8'

200 feet, more or less 24 inch EQUIV diameter, ____ foot joint $72.04 $14,408.00 8' $77.42 $15,484.00 8'

200 feet, more or less 30 inch EQUIV diameter, ____ foot joint $102.22 $20,444.00 8' $92.82 $18,564.00 8'

200 feet, more or less 36 inch  EQUIV diameter, ____ foot joint $135.60 $27,120.00 8' $124.72 $24,944.00 8'

200 feet, more or less 42 inch EQUIV diameter, ____ foot joint $184.29 $36,858.00 8' $160.07 $32,014.00 8'

200 feet, more or less 48 inch EQUIV diameter, ____ foot joint $236.99 $47,398.00 8' $206.21 $41,242.00 8'

200 feet, more or less 54 inch  EQUIV diameter, ____ foot joint $293.16 $58,632.00 8' No Bid 8'

200 feet, more or less 60 inch EQUIV diameter, ____ foot joint $365.81 $73,162.00 8' No Bid 8'

200 feet, more or less 72 inch EQUIV diameter, ____ foot joint $484.94 $96,988.00 8' No Bid 8'

TOTAL $3,268.98 $653,796.00 INCOMPLETE BID

REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE 

BID TAB SHEET

PW2026-09

05.14.2026

1:00 PM

ROUND PIPE

Bid Number:

Date:

ARCH PIPE DIAMETER

Time:

FOLEY SHADDIX
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