RESOLUTION NO, 2026-52
APPROVING CHANGE ORDER NO. 1 AND 2 FOR AQUA DESIGN SYSTEMS, INC.
WHEREAS, the Cullman City Council awarded the bid for the installation of a lazy river at the Wildwater Waterpark to Aqua Design
Systems, Inc. in the amount of $5,781,278.00;

WHEREAS, the City of Cullman wishes to approve Change Order No. 1 and 2 for a deduction for pipes and fittings, and an increase
for surveying; for an overall decrease to the total project cost by $303,889.79 to $5,477,388.21

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Cullman City Council that the Mayor is authorized to execute Change Order No. 1 and 2
which will decrease the total cost of the contract with Aqua Design Systems, Inc, to $5,477,388.21.

ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL this the 15™ day of December, 2025.

President of the City Council

ATTEST:

City Clerk

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR this the 15% day of December, 2025.

Mayor



Requested Change Order
Order#: 225027-2
Order Date: 12/10/2025

V&
e,

esign systems

To: City of Cullman AL Project: 225027
204 2nd Avenue NE Wildwater Waterpark Lazy River Expansion
Cullman AL 35055 1707 Main Ave SW
Cullman AL 35055

The contracior agrees to perform and the owner agrees to

pay for the following changes to this contract, AELEGHEL LT D
Ordered By: Customer Order: Specifications Attached |:|
Description of Work Amount
Add for Surveying Aqua to pay lo the balance 10,000.00
Notes

By PO s S o) e esaidet Requested Amount of Change 10,000.00

The criginal Contract Sumwas . —— S e T : 5,576,907.00
Net change by previous Change Orders ... ... 0.00
The Contract Sum prior to this Change Order . 5,576,907.00
The Contract Sum will be changed by this Change Order . .. 10.000.00
The new Contract Sum including this Change Order willbe ... ... .. i 5,586,907.00
The Contract Time will be changed by . 0 Days
Owner: Date:

Contractor: Date:




Requested

§ desngn systems

To: City of Cullman AL Project:

204 2nd Avenue NE
Cullman AL 35055

Change Order
Orderi; 225027-1
Order Date: 12/10/2025

225027

Wildwater Waterpark Lazy River Expansion
1707 Main Ave SW

Cullman AL 35055

The contractor agrees to perform and the owner agrees to
pay for the following changes to this contract.

Plans Attached [}

Ordered By: 826 Jared Redding Customer Qrcler: Specifications Attached { |

Description of Work Amount

Alsco Fittings -212,591.79

PVF Pipe -101,298.00

Notes

Negative changes will lower the overall contract

price requiringgno additional payment by owner. Requested Amount of Change -313,889.79
The original Contract SUM WaSs ... ..o 5,5-76,907.00
Net change by previous Change Orders ..o — 0.00
The Contract Sum prior to this Change Order i m o U e e 5,576,907.00
The Contract Sum will be changed by this Change Order .................................................................... -313,889.79
The new Contract Sum including this Change Order willbe ... U 5,263,017.21
The Contract Time will be changed by ........ S e e " 0 Days

Owner: Date:

Contractor: Date:




RESOLUTION NO. 2025 - 91

TO AWARD BID FOR THE INSTALLATION OF THE LAZY RIVER PROJECT

WHEREAS, bids were received on September 25, 2025 at 2:00 p.m. for the installation of a lazy river at the Wildwater Waterpark; and

WHEREAS, the following bids were opened:

Aqua Design Systems, Inc. Fayetteville, GA $5,781,278.00
Burleson Pool Company, Inc. Hampton Cove, AL $7,107,000.00
RDC Design Build, Inc. Pittsburg, PA No Bid
Rotolo Consultants, Inc. Stidell, LA No Bid
Texas Aquatic Construction, Inc.  Dallas, TX No Bid
Weller Pools, LLC Apopka, FL No Bid

WHEREAS, the recommendation is to award the bid to Aqua Design Systems, Inc., the lowest responsible bidder; and

BE IT RESOLVED by the Cullman City Council that the bid for the installation of a lazy river at the Wildwater Waterpark be
awarded to Aqua Design Systems, Inc. the lowest responsible bidder, in the amount of $5,781,278.00.

Presglent of the Gifg' Council

ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL this the 29th day of September, 2025.

ATTEST:

City Clerk

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR this the 26th day of September, 2025,

S



